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JOURNAL NO. 33 

ROOSEVELT COUNTY MONTANA 
 
ROOSEVELT COUNTY COMMISSIONER’S PROCEDURES FOR SEPTEMBER 2025 

September 2, 2025 

Bridge 1010 Bid Opening  

Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Lindsey McNabb, DES Coordinator; John Bach, Interstate 
Engineering; Bill VanderWeele, Northern Plains Independent Newspaper; Ryan 
Schaner, Bishop.  

Commissioner Oelkers called the meeting to order at 10:30 A.M.  

Bridge 1010 Bid Opening 
The bids were due today by 10:00 A.M.  
There were five bids, one hand delivered and four online, they were open as follows: 

1. Young Guns Construction LLC in the amount of $757,325.34. 
2. Strata Corporation in the amount of $595,862.00, one disqualification no bid 

date.  
3. Franz Construction Inc. in the amount of $ 520,767.60. 
4. Thompson Contracting Inc. in the amount of $501,362.59.  
5. Bishop Inc. in the amount of $496,780.00.  

 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to take bids under advisement with 
Interstate Engineering and take action at the next regular public meeting, seconded 
by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
 
Note the video recording did not record.   

Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn.  
Commissioner Marottek seconded.  
Meeting adjourned at 10:36 A.M.  
 

September 2, 2025 

Regular Public Meeting  

Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Lindsey McNabb, DES Coordinator (taking notes); John Bach, 
Interstate Engineering; Bill Juve; Bill VanderWeele, Northern Plains Independent 
Newspaper. 
Zoom: Clayton Vine, GIS  
 
Commissioner Oelkers called the meeting to order at 11:00 A.M.  
 
Public Comment: None  
Commissioner Update:  
Doug had no update.  Robert stated he worked on a few road issues that came up but 
other than that business as usual in the office.  Gordon stated he attended the 
Montana Petroleum Meeting in Billings, the Lanark area will be getting a few wells.  
Senator Sheehy representative came and visted with the Commissioners last week 
they talked about Amtrak, keeping it on the hi-line and the pilt program monies. Next 
week Gordon will be attending the Big Sky Rail Conference in Livingston.   
Minutes: 
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Minutes for the Teamsters Union Negotiations of July 8, 2025  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the Teamsters 
union negotiations of July 8, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Gravel Bid Opening of July 22, 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the gravel bid 
opening of July 22, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Special Public Meeting of July 22, 2025  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the special 
public meeting of July 22, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Special Public Meeting of July 29, 2025  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the special 
public meeting of July 29, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek. Passed  
Minutes for the Month of July 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the month of 
July 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Special Public Meeting of August 18, 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the special 
public meeting of August 18, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Special Public Meeting of August 19, 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the special 
public meeting of August 19, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Month of August 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the month of 
August 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Administrative Issues: 
Action on an Addendum to Payroll Policy of the Policy Handbook  
Addendum: Pay & Benefits  
If an employee retires, quits or is terminated their final paycheck will be paid on the 
current payroll cycle.  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the addendum to the payroll 
policy of the County Policy Handbook, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Action on Gravel Bids for North of Poplar Pit and Picard Pit  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Gratech bid for the North 
Poplar Pit, seconded by Commissioner Marottek. Passed  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Bishop bid for the Picard Pit, 
seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Action on Purchasing Four Vehicles for the Sheriff’s Office  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Sheriff’s Office request to 
purchase two Ford Explorer’s in the amount of $97,000 and one Ford F-150 in the 
amount of $50,200.00, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Sheriff’s Office request to 
purchase one Ram 1500 in the amount of $56,200.00, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek. Passed  
Claims: 
Claims for August 20, 2025 in the amount of $192,039.04 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the claims for August 20, 2025 
in the amount of $192,039.04, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Pay Raise: None  
New Hire: None  
Additional Administrative Issues: None  
New Business: None  
Unfinished Business: None  
 
Note the video recording did not work.             
 
Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn. 
Commissioner Marottek seconded.  
Meeting adjourned at 11:14 A.M. 
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September 3, 2025 
 
Special Public Meeting  
Budget Meeting  
 
Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Tracy Miranda, Clerk and Recorder; Bill VanderWeele, Northern 
Plains Independent.  
  
Commissioner Oelkers called the meeting to order at 11:00am 
 
Action on Resolution 2026-4, Adopting the Final Operating Budget for Fiscal 
Year 25-26 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Resolution 2026-4, Adopting 
the Final Operating Budget for Fiscal Year 2025-2026, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek.  Passed  
Discussion: Gordon said this is the resolution that sets the budget for FY 2025-26 

RESOLUTION NO. 2026-4 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE FINAL OPERATING BUDGET AND SETTING 
APPROPRIATION AUTHORITY FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING JULY 1, 2025 AND 
ENDING JUNE 30, 2026 

WHEREAS, Section 7-6-4030, MCA, provides that the governing body shall adopt the final budget by 
resolution. The resolution must: 

(a) Authorize appropriations to defray the expenses or liabilities for the fiscal year; 
(b) Establish legal spending limits at the level of detail in the resolution; and 
(c) Include any increase in property taxes, including an increase authorized under 15-10-420(1) 

and the amount by which property taxes will increase on homes valued at $100,000, 
$300,000 and $600,000. 

WHEREAS, Section 7-6-4020 requires that a preliminary annual operating budget must be prepared 
for the local government; and 

WHEREAS, Section 7-6-4021 requires that the governing body shall cause a notice of public hearing 
on the preliminary or amended budget to be published, and 

WHEREAS, Section 7-6-4024, provides that the governing body must hold a public hearing in 
accordance with the notice given pursuant to 7-6-4021; and  

WHEREAS, The Board of County Commissioners held a public hearing on September 3, 2025 where 
residents of the County were allowed to express their concerns about the proposed budget; and 

WHEREAS, The Board of County Commissioners has reviewed the proposed budget, received the 
estimated ending cash balances for all county funds, made changes to the budget as deemed necessary 
following the public hearing(s) and from input by elected officials and department heads, and computed 
the estimated taxes, fees and assessments needed to fund the fiscal year 2026 budget. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of Roosevelt 
County that: 

The final budget after any amendments to the preliminary budget and after considering any 
public comment is adopted.  

This resolution authorizes: 

(a) Appropriations to defray the expenses or liabilities for the fiscal year. 
(b) It sets the legal spending limits at the county fund level. Fund level details are stated in 

the formal budget document and established in the County’s accounting system. 
(c) An increase in county wide property taxes due to (15-10-420 calculation), permissive levy 

and jail bond levy, of $7.39, $22.16, and $44.30, respectively for a home valued at $100,000, 
$300,000, and $600,000 is included in this fiscal year budget.  



988 
 

(d) An increase in the rural county road property taxes due to (15-10-420 calculation) of $2.31, 
$6.93, and $13.85, respectively for a home valued at $100,000, 300,000, and $600,000 is 
included in this fiscal year budget. 

The effective date of this resolution is July 1, 2025, even if the resolution is adopted after that 
date.  

DATED this 3rd day of September, 2025. 
   

BOARD OF COUNTY 
COMMISSIONERS 

 
/s/ Gordon Oelkers  
Presiding Officer 
 
/s/ Robert Toavs  
Member 
 
/s/ Doug Marottek  
Member 

ATTEST: 
/s/ Tracy Miranda   
Clerk of the Board 
Action on Resolution 2026-5, Establishing the Method of Levying Voted Mills  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Resolution 2026-5, 
Establishing the method of levying voted mills, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  
Passed  
Discussion: Gordon stated this is to set the budget for 2025-26 and how we calculate 
the voted mills using 15-10-420. This is the method that has been used in the past 
and after fiscal year 2025-2026 the method on calculating the mills will change.  

RESOLUTION NO. 2026-5 
 

RESOLUTION ESTABLISHING THE METHOD OF LEVYING VOTED MILLS PER HB231 AND 
SB542 PASSED IN THE 2025 MONTANA LEGISLATURE 

 
WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Roosevelt County, Montana, has determined that 
voter approved mill levies are required to be recalculated under two new bills passed by the 2025 
Legislature; and 
 
WHEREAS, the new legislation requires that voted mills use one of two methods to recalculate the 
mill levy. The first method starts with the FY2025 assessed tax revenue for the voted levy and applies 
the formula in MCA 15-10-420 for FY2026 and all future years of the levy. The second method uses the 
FY2025 assessed tax revenue and calculates the number of mills required to levy that amount of 
revenue using the FY2026 taxable value. That number of mills is the maximum number of mills to be 
levied for FY2026 and all future years; and 
 
WHEREAS, Roosevelt County has the following voter approved mill levies: 2110 Road Fund (8 Mills), 
2300- Public Safety Fund (7 Mills), 7370- Hospital 1 & 9 Ambulance Fund (3 Mills), 7371 Poplar 
Hospital District (3 Mills), 7372- Culbertson Hospital District( 3 Mills), 7373 Culbertson Hospital 
District Emergency Medical Services (9 Mills), 7374- Hospital District 3 & 45 (3 Mills), 7375- Hospital 
3 & 45 Ambulance (3 Mills); and  
 
NOW THERFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by this Board of County Commissioners that the 2110 Road 
Fund (8 Mills), 2300 Public Safety Fund (7 Mills), 7370 Hospital 1 & 9 Ambulance Fund (3 Mills), 7371 
Poplar Hospital District (3 Mills), 7372 Culbertson Hospital District( 3 Mills), 7373 Culbertson 
Hospital District Emergency Medical Services (9 Mills), 7374 Hospital District 3 & 45 (3 Mills), 7375 
Hospital 3 & 45 Ambulance (3 Mills),  mill levies will be recalculated using FY2025 assessed tax 
revenue for the voted levy and applies the formula in MCA 15-10-420 for FY2026 and all future years 
of the levy. 
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS 3rd DAY OF SEPTEMBER, 2025  
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BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
      /s/ Gordon Oelkers 
      Presiding Officer 
 
ATTEST:     /s/ Robert Toavs  
      Member 
 
/s/ Tracy Miranda       /s/ Doug Marottek 
County Clerk and Clerk of the Board   Member 
Of County Commissioners  
 
Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn. 
Commissioner Doug seconded.  
Meeting adjourned at 11:12 A.M.  
 
September 16, 2025 

Regular Public Meeting 

Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Lindsey McNabb, DES Coordinator (taking notes); John Bach, 
Interstate Engineering; Bill VanderWeele, Northern Plains Independent Newspaper; 
Bill Juve.  
Zoom: Clayton Vine, GIS  
 
Commissioner Oelkers called the meeting to order at 11:00 A.M.  
 
Public Comment: None  
Commissioner Update:  
Doug stated he attended a security meeting with the Courts, they are working on a 
few security issue projects in the courtroom such as cameras.  Roberts stated he is 
working with the Road Foreman.  Derek has a plan for the elevator road, hoping to 
start the project this fall. Interstate Engineering ran a test on the materials on the 
road and there is only 3 percent clay in it. Gordon stated he went to the Big Sky Rail 
meeting in Livingston this past week, he is voice for keeping the Amtrak northern 
routes, but the Senators office is pushing for keeping both the south and north routes.  
Gordon is concerned that the money won’t be there to keep both routes going.  
Minutes: 
Minutes for the Bridge 1010 Bid Opening of September 2, 2025  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the bridge 
1010 bid opening of September 2, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Regular Public Meeting of September 2, 2025  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the regular 
public meeting of September 2, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Minutes for the Special Public Meeting Budget Adoption of September 3, 
2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the special 
public meeting budget adoption of September 3, 2025, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek.  Passed  
Administrative Issues: 
Action on Teamsters Local Union Agreement 2025-2027 for the Sheriff’s 
Office  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the Teamsters Local Union 
agreement 2025-2027 for the Sheriff’s Office, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  
Passed  
Action on Notice of Award for the Shotgun Creek Bridge Replacement Bid  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Bishop bid in the amount of 
$496,780.00 for the Shotgun Creek bridge replacement project on road 1010, seconded 
by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
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Discussion: This project will use the funds from the Senate Bill 536 money.  
Action on Reappointment of Judy Romo to the Council on Aging Board  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve reappointment of Judy Romo 
to the Council on Aging Board, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Action on Reappointment of James Harvey to the Council on Aging Board  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve reappointment of James 
Harvey to the Council on Aging Board, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Action on Sheriff’s Request to Make a Resolution Retiring Badge R13 in 
Memory of Michael Ellerton  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Resolution 2026-6, retiring 
badge R13 in memory of Michael Ellerton, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  
Passed  
 

RESOLUTION NO. 2026-6 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS OF ROOSEVELT 
COUNTY, MONTANA, RETIRING THE DEPUTY COUNTY 

SHERIFF BADGE OF MICHAEL ELLERTON 
 
 WHEREAS, Michael Ellerton, Sergeant of Roosevelt County, Montana, died on July 1, 2025; 
and 
 
 WHEREAS, Sergeant Ellerton served Roosevelt County, Montana in the capacity of Deputy 
Sheriff for 6 years; and 
 
 WHEREAS, Sergeant Ellerton served Roosevelt County with honorable service and 
commitment to high standards of integrity and dedication to duty in his service to law enforcement and 
the people of Roosevelt County, Montana; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Roosevelt County wish to honor Sergeant 
Ellerton for his service to law enforcement and the people of Roosevelt County, Montana by retiring his 
Deputy County Sheriff Badge No. 13.  
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COUNTY 
COMMISSIONERS OF ROOSEVELT COUNTY, MONTANA, AS FOLLOWS:  
 
 That Sergeant Micheal Ellerton’s Badge No. 13 is hereby officially retired in his honor, and said 
Badge No. 13 will be used only in his name and memory. 
 
 PASSED AND ADOPTED this 16th  day of September, 2025. 
 
     ROOSEVELT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
 
      /s/ Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer  
 
       
      /s/Robert Toavs, Member 
 
       
      /s/ Doug Marottek, Member  
ATTEST: 
 
/s/ Tracy Miranda  
County Clerk and Recorder 
Resignation from Aging Employee Carol Rasmussen  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to accept resignation from Aging Services 
employee Carol Rasmussen effective November 30, 2025, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek.  Passed  
Claims: 
Claims for September 6, 2025 in the amount of $161,712.30 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the claims for September 6, 
2025 in the amount of $161,712.30, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Pay Raises: 
Annual Pay Raise for Dispatch Employee Delano Eymard  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve annual pay raise for Dispatch 
employee Delano Eymard, seconded by Commissioner Marottek. Passed  
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Annual Pay Raise for Library Employee Amy Heller  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve annual pay raise for Library 
employee Amy Heller, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Annual Pay Raise for Justice Court Culbertson Employee Penni Benkler  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve annual pay raise for Justice 
Court Culbertson employee Penni Benkler, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  
Passed  
New Hire: 
Adam Wienberger to the Sheriff’s Office  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve new hire of Adam Wienberger 
to the Sheriff’s Office, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Kristi BigLeggins to the Aging Services  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve new hire of Kristi BigLeggins 
to the Aging Services, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Additional Administrative Issues: 
Promotion Raise for Sheriff’s Employee Centennial (CJ) Colon  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve promotion raise for Sheriff’s 
Office employee Centennial Colon, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed 
Action on Accepting the Position Change from Substitute to Head Cook for 
Bainville Aging Services  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve position change for Amber 
Anderson from substitute to head cook for Bainville Aging Services effective 
December 1, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
New Business: None  
Unfinished Business: None  
 
Note: The video recording did not work.  
 
Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn  
Commissioner Marottek seconded. 
Meeting adjourned at 11:18 A.M.   
 
September 30, 2025 

Tax Deed Sale  

Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Lindsey McNabb, DES Coordinator; Tori Matejovsky, GNDC; 
Mathew Lange; Gabriel O’Hare. 

Commissioner Oelkers opened the Tax Deed Sale at 9:00 A.M.  

Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 1.  
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 2.  
No bid, No sale. 
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 3. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 4. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 5. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 6. 
No bid, No sale.  
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Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 7. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 8. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 9. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 10. 
No bid, No sale.  
 
Commissioner Oelkers asked for a bid on item number 11. 
No bid, No sale.  
Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn.  
Commissioner Marottek seconded.  
Meeting adjourned at 9:09 A.M.  
September 30,2025 

Regular Public Meeting  

Present: Commissioners Gordon Oelkers, Presiding Officer; Robert Toavs and Doug 
Marottek, Members; Lindsey McNabb, DES Coordinator; Bill VanderWeele, Northern 
Plains Independent Newspaper; Bill Juve.  
Zoom: Clayton Vine, GIS  
 
Commissioner Oelkers called the meeting to order at 11:00 A.M.  
 
Public Comment: 
Mr. VanderWeele asked about the recent incidents in Wolf Point. Gordon stated that 
Doug has been going to the security meeting that Judge Fosland put together. The 
county has updated dash cams, updated the radios.   On the third floor of the 
courthouse there are no guns allowed a resolution was passed, updated the courtroom 
benches to bullet proof, all panic buttons throughout the courthouse are all working 
now.  
Commissioner Update: 
Doug reported he attended the MACO conference in Great Falls.  Robert reported he 
attended the MACO conference as well. On Monday there was fair board meeting.  
Robert congratulated Gordon on elected president of MACO. Gordon reported at the 
MACO conference he attended meetings on land, oil and gas and energy.   
Minutes: 
Minutes for the Regular Public Meeting of September 16, 2025 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the minutes for the regular 
public meeting of September 16, 2025, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Administrative Issues: 
Action on Pest Control with Advance Solutions LLC 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the quote from Advance 
Solutions LLC in the amount of $2,400.00 a year, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek.  Passed  
Discussion: 
The quote includes County Shops Wolf Point, McCabe, Poplar and Bainville; Library 
X4; Aging Center X4. It should only be Culbertson and Wolf Point Libraries; the 
Commissioners will look into this.  
Claims: 
Claims for September 18, 2025 in the amount of $761,145.77 
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve the claims for September 18, 
2025 in the amount of $761,145.77, seconded by Commissioner Marottek.  Passed  
Pay Raises: None  
New Hire: None  
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Additional Administrative Issues: 
Action on advertising gravel bid at the Pronto Pit  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Road Department request to 
call for bid for gravel at the Pronto Pit North of Brockton, seconded by Commissioner 
Marottek.  Passed  
Action on Economic Summit Training  
A motion was made by Commissioner Toavs to approve Commissioner Oelkers to 
attend the Economic Summit on October 16, 2025 in Bozeman with a registration fee 
of $200.00, seconded by Commissioner Marottek. Passed  
New Business: None  
Unfinished Business: None  
 
Commissioner Toavs moved to adjourn. 
Commissioner Marottek seconded.  
Meeting adjourned at 11:17 A.M.  
 

CLAIMS: The Board has now completed the auditing of all claims presented for payment and 
ordered the following: 

  1000 GENERAL 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                 102,348.21 
  2110 ROAD FUND (8 VOTED MILLS) 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                 180,907.39 
  2140 NOXIOUS WEED 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   7,208.09 
  2160 COUNTY FAIR FUND 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                  18,711.77 
  2200 MOSQUITO CONTROL 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                     214.00 
  2220 LIBRARY 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   4,212.89 
  2280 SENIOR CITIZENS 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   5,099.36 
  2290 EXTENSION SERVICE 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   5,162.98 
  2300 PUBLIC SAFETY(7 VOTED MILLS) 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                  50,604.16 
  2360 ROOSEVELT CO MUSEUM 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   1,068.92 
  2460 MCCABE SPECIAL 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                      78.20 
  2795 COMMUNITY OF BROCKTON 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                     341.67 
  2800 ALCOHOL & DRUG ABUSE 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                  10,124.00 
  2850 911 EMERGENCY 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   7,217.09 
  2979 CFDC-BIOTERRORISM GRANT 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                     192.14 
  5210 WATER OPERAT-BROCKTON 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                     477.87 
  5310 SEWER OPERAT-BROCKTON 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   1,688.05 
  5410 SOLID WASTE OPER-BROCKTON 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                     922.15 
  7380 WOLF POINT TV 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                  14,439.69 
  7385 POPLAR TV 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   8,599.89 
  7920 REFUNDS 
    101000 CASH/CASH EQUIVALENTS                                   2,753.86 
  
  
                                                Total:           422,372.38 
 
 
TOTAL PAYROLL WITH WORKERS COMP & UNEMPLOYMENT: $851,222.89 
 
 
     TOTAL CLAIMS AND PAYROLL FOR AUGUST 2025: $1,774,080.96 
 
 
ABATEMENTS APPROVED: 5842 



994 
 

FEES RECEIVED: The following fees for the month of August were received from various 
offices: 

Clerk and Recorder              $11,445.00 

JP Wolf Point                $ 

JP Culbertson                            $4,105.28 

Clerk of District Court                            $ 

 Sheriff                               $1,350.00 

INVESTMENT INTEREST: County Treasurer Betty Romo reported the County had received 
investment interest for the month of August from the following: 

 Opportunity Bank Savings Interest   $ 

 Opportunity Bank Checking Interest   $ 

 Opportunity Bank STIP Interest               $141,167.74 

. Opportunity Bank Money Market   $2,866.23 

 Independence Bank Savings Interest   $247.33 

 Opportunity Bank CD Interest    $ 
 
 Buchanan Capitol (Charles Schwab) Interest  $6,050.69 
 
 MBS Inc Bond Interest     $2,751.79 
 
DEPOSITS:  The following listed checks were deposited with the County Treasurer 
$20,268.40- FY26 Fuel Tax from State of Montana to Gasoline Tax Fund. 
$77,569.28- Oil Royalties from Kraken Oil to General Fund.  
$292.20- Oil Royalties from Foundation Energy to General Fund.  
$1,420.63- Reimbursement from City of Wolf Point for JP Clerk to General Fund.  
$26,046.81- Oil Royalties from Phoenix Operating LLC to General Fund.  
$8,458.42- Oil Royalties from Oasis Petroleum to General Fund.  
$300.00- Approach Permit Fee from Kraken Operating to Road Fund.  
$300.00- Approach Permit Fee from Kraken Operating to Road Fund.  
$95,184.31- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to General Fund 
$65,719.75- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Road Fund 
$13,003.80- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Bridge Fund 
$3,821.04- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Noxious Weed Fund. 
$4,229.73- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to County Fair Fund.  
$1,665.44- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Airport Fund.  
$5,856.02- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Comprehensive Insurance Fund.  
$1,233.27- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Mosquito Control Fund.  
$11,674.97- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Library Fund. 
$3,454.91- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Senior Citizen Fund.  
$4,278.95- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Extension Service Fund. 
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$56,813.80- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Public Safety Fund.  
$967.13- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Roosevelt County Museum Fund.  
$14,723.73- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Permissive Medical Fund.  
$4,383.12- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Community of Brockton.  
$5,192.31- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Jail G.O Debt Fund.  
$1,595.41- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Rural Fire District 64 Fund.  
$385.55- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Soil Conservation Fund.  
$632.77- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Hospital 1 & 9 Ambulance Fund.  
$3,649.74- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Hospital 1 & 9 Fund.  
$7,194.79- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Hospital 17, 64 & 65 Fund.  
$545.70- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Culbertson District EMS Fund.  
$4,138.92- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Hospital 3 & 45 Fund. 
$475.75- FY26 First Quarter Entitlement Share from Montana Department of 
Revenue to Hospital 3 & 45 Ambulance Fund.  
$1,030.47- Oil Royalties from Devon Energy to General Fund.  
$100.00- Conference Room Rent from JPT to General Fund. 
$23,197.56- FY 26 Monthly Fuel Tax from State of Montana to Gasoline Tax Fund.  
$888.01- Oil Royalties from White Rock Oil & Gas to General Fund.  
$417.86- Reimbursement from US Treasury to Community of Brockton Fund.  
$300.00- Approach Permit Fee from Brian Reynolds to Road Fund. 
$1,176.22- Oil Royalties from Citation Oil & Gas to General Fund. 
$200.00- Tower Rent from FBI to General Fund.  
$199.86- Oil Royalties from Prim Exploration to General Fund.  
$352.36- Oil Royalties from Darrah to General Fund.  
$400.00- Tower Rent from State of Montana to General Fund.  
$1,420.63- Reimbursement from City of Wolf Point for JP Clerk to General Fund. 
$5,000.00- Reimbursement from Stentoft for Cattle Guard to Road Fund.  
$54,456.88- Oil Royalties from Kraken Oil to General Fund.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
________________________________________           ATTEST: _____________________________________ 
Presiding Officer  
BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS                                COUNTY CLERK AND CLERK OF 
THE BOARD ROOSEVELT COUNTY, MONTANA       OF COUNTY COMMISSIONER



 
 



 

 
 



 

 
 



 

 
 

 


